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OpenRecords <OpenRecords2@gbi.ga.gov> Fri, May 26, 2023 at 12:02 PM
To: Billy Blume <madvideos@gmail.com>

May 26, 2023

 

 

Mr. Billy Blume

Mad Videos

 

Reference: Brianna Grier   

ORM: 2023-5224

 

Dear Mr. Blume:

 

The following is in response to your April 28, 2023, Open Records request for records pertaining to Brianna Grier. 

 

In accordance with O.C.G.A. § 50-18-70 of the Open Records Act and based upon the information/search terms you
have provided; we have located the requested documents.

 

The cost to produce these records is $10.00 for the mailing fees and USB drive.  Please respond to this
correspondence with your agreement to pay. Once we receive your agreement to pay, we will send the records
including the invoice.

 

 

GBI Office of Privacy and Compliance

Open Records Unit

Openrecords2@gbi.ga.gov

404-270-8527
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Billy Blume <madvideos@gmail.com> Fri, May 26, 2023 at 12:07 PM
To: OpenRecords <openrecords2@gbi.ga.gov>

Yes I agree to pay $10.00

Mailing address

221 quail Dr, Hephzibah, GA 30815

Thanks
Billy 
[Quoted text hidden]

Billy Blume <madvideos@gmail.com> Fri, May 26, 2023 at 2:30 PM
To: OpenRecords <openrecords2@gbi.ga.gov>

Good day,

Yes, I agree to pay $10.00
221 Quail Dr, Hephzibah, GA 30815

Billy Blume

On Fri, May 26, 2023 at 12:02 PM OpenRecords <OpenRecords2@gbi.ga.gov> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]
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